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Aldelo Systems Inc. Certifies Odyssey Technologies, Inc. Hardware and Software 
Remote Eyes Digital Video Integrates to Aldelo Software 

 
 

Modesto, California, December 24, 2008 - Aldelo Systems Inc., the leading provider of low cost, feature 
rich and easy to use restaurant POS software solutions for the hospitality industry, has certified Odyssey 
Technologies, Inc. hardware and its Remote Eyes software for enhanced digital video management. 
 
“Aldelo Systems Inc. is pleased to partner with Odyssey Technologies, Inc, “stated Harry Tu, CEO.  
“Certification of Remote Eyes digital video management system and Odyssey hardware makes 
surveillance and its benefits easily available to our customers.” 
 
“Aldelo is recognized as one of the leading POS software providers in the hospitality industry, and 
Odyssey is very excited about the completion of this innovative and ground-breaking integration between 
its Remote Eyes® digital video management system and Aldelo’s POS software,” stated John Webster, 
CEO of Odyssey Technologies, Inc.  “Now Aldelo users can immediately enhance their installations with 
integrated video surveillance.  Our integration with Aldelo is software driven, meaning installation is as 
simple as placing the Remote Eyes server on the same network with the Aldelo system.  And users with 
multiple locations can use Odyssey’s enterprise management services to view transaction data and 
integrated video from all locations in a single interface.” 
 
About Aldelo:  Aldelo Systems Inc. develops software solutions for the hospitality industry and is a 
leading provider of point of sale and management systems for independent and chain establishments, 
including restaurants and food and beverage operations in hotels, resorts and clubs.  Aldelo has over 
40,000 installations in 15 countries, and manages a worldwide distribution network of more than 400 
dealers, which enforces the company's International position.  The Aldelo® For Restaurant software suite 
offers a complete set of solution to effectively manage restaurants of any size, earning a reputation for 
innovation and excellence by meeting and exceeding the needs of its customers.  To learn more about 
Aldelo Systems Inc., visit www.aldelo.com. 
 
About Odyssey Technologies, Inc. 
Odyssey Technologies, Inc. was founded in 1997 and is an early pioneer in digital video.  With over 9,000 
video surveillance systems installed worldwide, Odyssey differentiates itself by providing equipment, 
software, and services for centralizing and automating multi-site operations in Retail, Hospitality, Financial 
Services, and Property Management.  Remote Eyes systems feature superior video compression, multi-
site remote video management, and integration with point-of-sale, access control and networked 
transaction systems.  To learn more about Odyssey Technologies, Inc., please visit us at 
www.remoteeyes.com or e-mail Odyssey on sales@remoteeyes.com. 
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